
S U B O R D I N A T E  L E G I S L A T I O N   

2014 NO. 14 

THE NATIONAL HEALTH SERVICE (WALES) ACT 

2006 

The Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) 

(Wales) (Amendments) Directions 2014 

Made - - - - 16 June 2014 

Coming into force in accordance with direction 1(2) 

The Welsh Ministers give the following directions in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 

12(3), 45, 203(9) and (10) and 204(1) of the National Health Service (Wales) Act 2006(1).  

Title, commencement and application  

1.—(1) The title of these Directions is the Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced 

Services) (Wales) (Amendments) Directions 2014.   

(2) These Directions come into force on 17 June 2014 but have effect from 1 April 2014.          

(3) These Directions are given to Local Health Boards and apply in relation to Wales.  

Amendments to the Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) (No. 2) 

Directions 2009 

2. The Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) (No. 2) Directions 2009 

which came into force on 22 May 2009 are amended as follows: 

(a) in direction 4(2) (Extended Hours Access Scheme), in sub-paragraph (k)(i), for “£1.94”, 

substitute “£1.95”. 

(b) in direction 5 (Asylum Seeker and Refugee Scheme) —   

(i) in sub-paragraph (i)(aa) of paragraph (l), for “£101.75”, substitute “£102.73”; 

(ii) in sub-paragraph (i)(bb) of paragraph (l), for “£51.09”, substitute “£51.37”; and 

(iii) in sub-paragraph (i)(cc) of paragraph (l),  for “£51.09”, substitute “£51.37”. 

(c) in direction 6 (Homeless Scheme) — 

(i) in sub-paragraph (i)(aa) of paragraph (l), for  “£1,088.08”, substitute “£1,094.06”; 

and 

(ii) in sub-paragraph (i)(bb) of paragraph (l), for “£108.30”, substitute “£108.90”. 

(d) in direction 7 (Care Homes Scheme), in sub-paragraph (i) of paragraph (o), for “£153.26”, 

substitute “£154.10”. 

(e) in direction 8 (Diabetes Care Scheme) — 

(i) in sub-paragraph (i)(aa) of paragraph (i), for “£10.22”, substitute “£10.28”; and 

                                                                                                                                                               

 
(1)  2006 c.42.  



 

(ii) in sub-paragraph (i)(bb) of paragraph (i), for “£20.43”, substitute “£20.54”. 

Amendments to the Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) 

Directions 2007  

3. The Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) Directions 2007 which 

came into force on 12 December 2007 are amended as follows: 

(a) in direction 6 (Influenza and Pneumococcal Immunisation Scheme Plans) — 

(i) at the end of sub-paragraph (i)(gg), omit the word “or” ; and 

(ii) after sub-paragraph (i)(gg) insert— 

“(hh) Community First Responders(1),  

(ii) Locum Doctors, or”. 

(b) in direction 9(2) (Severe Mental Illness Scheme Plans), in sub-paragraph (g)(i), for 

“£100.00”, substitute “£100.55”.  

(c) in direction 10(2) (Learning Disabilities Scheme), in sub-paragraph (i)(i), for “£102.17”, 

substitute “£102.73”.  

 

Signed by Dr Grant L. Duncan, Deputy Director, Healthcare Policy Division under the 

authority of the Minister for Health and Social Services, one of the Welsh Ministers 

 

 

 

Date:  16 June 2014 

 

                                                                                                                                                               
 
(1) Community First Responders who provide direct emergency aid as part of a scheme operated by the Welsh Ambulance 

Service Trust. 


