
S U B O R D I N A T E  L E G I S L A T I O N

2010 NO. 33

THE NATIONAL HEALTH SERVICE (WALES) ACT 
2006

The Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) 
(Wales) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Directions 2010

Made - - - - 27 July 2010

Coming into force in accordance with direction 1(2)

The Welsh Ministers give the following directions in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 
12(3), 45, 203(9) and (10) and 204(1) of the National Health Service (Wales) Act 2006(1): 

Title, commencement and application 

1.—(1) The title of these Directions is the Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced 
Services) (Wales) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Directions 2010.  

(2) These Directions come into force on 28 July 2010 but have effect from 1 April 2010.         
(3) These Directions are given to Local Health Boards and apply in relation to Wales. 

Amendments to the Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) (No. 2) 
Directions 2009

2. The Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) (No. 2) Directions 2009 
which came into force on 22 May 2009 are amended as follows:

(a) in direction 4(2) (extended hours access scheme), in sub-paragraph (k)(i) for “£1.93”, 
substitute “£1.94”;

(b) in direction 5 (asylum seeker and refugee scheme) —
(i) in sub-paragraph (i)(aa) of paragraph (l) for “£101.75”, substitute “£102.17”,
(ii) in sub-paragraph (i)(bb) of paragraph (l) for “£50.88”, substitute “£51.09”, and

(iii) in sub-paragraph (i)(cc) of paragraph (l)  for “£50.88”, substitute “£51.09”;
(c) in direction 6 (homeless scheme) —

(i) in sub-paragraph (i)(aa) of paragraph (l) for  “£1,083.64” substitute “£1,088.08”, and
(ii) in sub-paragraph (i)(bb) of paragraph (l) for “£107.86” substitute “£108.30”;

(d) in direction 7 (care homes scheme), in sub-paragraph (i) of paragraph (o) for “£152.63” 
substitute “£153.26”; and

(e) in direction 8 (diabetes care scheme) —
(i) in sub-paragraph (i)(aa) of paragraph (i) for “£10.18” substitute “£10.22”, and

                                                                                                                                                              

(1) 2006 c.42.



2

(ii) in sub-paragraph (i)(bb) of paragraph (i) for “£20.35” substitute “£20.43”.

Amendments to the Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) 
Directions 2007

3. The Primary Medical Services (Directed Enhanced Services) (Wales) Directions 2007 which 
came into force on 12 December 2007 are amended as follows:

(a) in direction 9(2) (severe mental illness scheme plans), in sub-paragraph (e)(i) for 
“£81.40” substitute “£81.73”; and

(b) in direction 10(2) (learning disabilities scheme), in sub-paragraph (i)(i) for “£101.75” 
substitute “£102.17”. 

Signed by Simon Dean, Director of Strategy and Planning, Health and Social Services 
Directorate General, under the authority of the Minister for Health and Social Services, one 
of the Welsh Ministers

Date: 27 July 2010


