SUBORDINATE
LEGISLATION

2018 No. (W.54)

THE NATIONAL HEALTH
SERVICE (WALES) ACT 2006

The Wales Infected Blood Support
Scheme (Amendment) Directions
2018

Made 18June 2018
Coming into force 19 June 2018

The Welsh Ministers give the following Directions in
exercise of the powers conferred by sections 19(1),
203(9) and (10) and 204(1) of the National Health
Service (Wales) Act 2006(1).

Title, commencement, application and
interpretation

1.—(1) The title of these Directions is the Wales
Infected Blood Support Scheme (Amendment)
Directions 2018.

(2) These Directions come into force on 19 June
2018.

(3) These Directions are given to Velindre NHS
Trust(2) and apply in relation to Wales.

(4) In these Directions—

“the Principal Directions” (“y Prif Gyfarwyddydau”)
means the Wales Infected Blood Support Scheme
(No.2) Directions 2017.

Amendments to the Principal Directions

2. The Principal Directions are amended as
follows—

(a) in paragraph 1 of Schedule 1, for “£4,500”
substitute “£4,622”;

(1) 2006 c.42.

(2) Velindre NHS Trust as established by Velindre National Health
Service Trust (Establishment) Order 1993 (S.I. 1993/2838) (as
amended).



(b) in paragraph 1 of Schedule 2, for “£17,500”
substitute “£18,5007;

(c) in paragraph 1 of Schedule 3, for £17,500”
substitute “£18,500”;

(d) n paragraph 1 of Schedule 4, for “£21,500”
substitute “£22,500; and

(e) in paragraph 2 of Schedule 4, for “£34,500”
substitute “£36,500”.

C))\/\/\N‘ \ ﬁ/vuﬂ

Professor Chris Jones,

Deputy Chief Medical Officer, Welsh Government,
under the authority of the Cabinet Secretary for Health

and Social Services, one of the Welsh Ministers
Date 18 June 2018



