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17 February 2021 

 
Dear  
 
ATISN 14775 – Vaccination numbers in Cardiff   
 
Thank you for your request to the Welsh Government for information under the Freedom of 
Information Act (2000) received on 18 January.  You requested the following information - 
 
1. How many over 80s live in Cardiff and the Vale?  
2. How many have actually been vaccinated by today?  
3. How many care homes are there in Cardiff and the Vale and how many residents do they 

have?  
4. How many care home residents have actually been vaccinated by today?  
5. When will shielding people over 80 be called for a vaccine?  
6. Why haven't those shielding over 80 been called already?  
7. How many vaccinations per day are actually being done in Cardiff and the Vale?  
8. What is the total population of over 50s in Cardiff and the Vale?  
 

On question 1, this information is readily available at the link attached below –  
https://statswales.gov.wales/Catalogue/Population-and-
Migration/Population/Estimates/Local-Health-Boards/populationestimates-by-lhb-age 
 
On question 2, Welsh Government does not hold this information at this level of analysis. To 
clarify, Welsh Government holds information relating to the number of over 80’s vaccinated 
in Wales and the number of individuals vaccinated in Cardiff and Vale. However, we do not 
hold information on the number of over 80’s vaccinated within Cardiff and Vale as 
requested.  
 
On question 3, Welsh Government does not hold this information. To clarify, Welsh 
Government holds information on the amount of care homes within Cardiff and the Vale, 
additionally, we hold information on the maximum capacity per home. However, we do not 
hold active information relating to the amount of individuals currently occupying each 
individual care home.  
 
On question 4, Welsh Government does not hold this information at this level of analysis. To 
clarify, Welsh Government holds this information at a national level. However, we do not 
hold this information at a district level as requested.  
 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fstatswales.gov.wales%2FCatalogue%2FPopulation-and-Migration%2FPopulation%2FEstimates%2FLocal-Health-Boards%2Fpopulationestimates-by-lhb-age&data=04%7C01%7CJoseph.Beese%40gov.wales%7Cc0d979a2d3f1455730ab08d8cd0e8e0c%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637484809677321266%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=vxnf1NVX6VEhEU%2FHZ2jhizMp2uW5PfAkqIfo%2BwuNC94%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fstatswales.gov.wales%2FCatalogue%2FPopulation-and-Migration%2FPopulation%2FEstimates%2FLocal-Health-Boards%2Fpopulationestimates-by-lhb-age&data=04%7C01%7CJoseph.Beese%40gov.wales%7Cc0d979a2d3f1455730ab08d8cd0e8e0c%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637484809677321266%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=vxnf1NVX6VEhEU%2FHZ2jhizMp2uW5PfAkqIfo%2BwuNC94%3D&reserved=0


 

 

On question 5, people over 80 are in cohort 2 of JCVI prioritisation list and this cohort are 
already being called for vaccination. 
 
On question 6, please see response at question 5.  
 
On question 7, we are unable to provide you with this information. To explain, we are 
continually ramping up our vaccine delivery on a daily basis, therefore, it is not possible to 
provide you with a specific number of vaccines administered per day as this rate is variable 
and fluctuates on a daily basis.  
 
On question 8, this information is readily available at the link attached below – 
https://statswales.gov.wales/Catalogue/Population-and-
Migration/Population/Estimates/Local-Health-Boards/populationestimates-by-lhb-age 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can ask    
for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  Requests for an 
internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s Freedom of Information 
Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government, 
Cathays Park,  
Cardiff,  
CF10 3NQ  
or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:   
 
Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
Cheshire,  
SK9 5AF. 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it 
has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fstatswales.gov.wales%2FCatalogue%2FPopulation-and-Migration%2FPopulation%2FEstimates%2FLocal-Health-Boards%2Fpopulationestimates-by-lhb-age&data=04%7C01%7CJoseph.Beese%40gov.wales%7Cc0d979a2d3f1455730ab08d8cd0e8e0c%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637484809677331257%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=FDEhFuRmWDeFd7t2%2F4P96WFSsdWMR7KodqAS7Db0H4I%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fstatswales.gov.wales%2FCatalogue%2FPopulation-and-Migration%2FPopulation%2FEstimates%2FLocal-Health-Boards%2Fpopulationestimates-by-lhb-age&data=04%7C01%7CJoseph.Beese%40gov.wales%7Cc0d979a2d3f1455730ab08d8cd0e8e0c%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637484809677331257%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=FDEhFuRmWDeFd7t2%2F4P96WFSsdWMR7KodqAS7Db0H4I%3D&reserved=0
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