

10 February 2023

Dear

ATISN 17050 – Anti Racism Wales Action Plan

Information requested

Thank you for your request dated 14 January 2022.

You asked:

1. How many written responses did you have for the Anti Racism Wales Action Plan?
2. How many did you have in English, and how many did you have in Welsh?
3. What proportion of key performance indicators were achieved by March 2022?
What KPIs were these?
4. How many organisations have been awarded as "leads and partners"? Of these, what % are:
 - White-led and based in Wales
 - Black, Asian and Minority Ethnic led and based in England
 - BAME-led and based in Wales
 - White led and based in England
5. How did the Anti Racism Wales Action Plan give due regard to the Welsh Language Act?
6. Please provide the Welsh Language Commissioner's consultation response.
7. How has the Welsh government regulated the public sector equality duty in organisations that are beneficiaries of Welsh government funding, such as Creative Wales from 2011 onwards?
8. How many BAME people have published books with grants that have been disseminated by organisations funded by Welsh Gov, who regulates PSED when it comes to funding?
9. How much money did it cost to make the anti-racism Wales action plan?
10. Please provide BFI's consultation response to the ARWAP

A response is provided on the following pages.

Next steps

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government's handling of your request, you can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response. Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government's Freedom of Information Officer at:

Information Rights Unit,
Welsh Government,
Cathays Park,
Cardiff,
CF10 3NQ

or email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office,
Wycliffe House,
Water Lane,
Wilmslow,
Cheshire,
SK9 5AF.

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it has been through our own internal review process.

Yours sincerely

Responses:

1. How many written responses did you have for the Anti Racism Wales Action Plan?

330 responses were received as set out in the published summary of responses: [Race Equality Action Plan: An Anti-racist Wales | GOV.WALES](#)

2. How many did you have in English, and how many did you have in Welsh?

Two written responses were in Welsh only. The remaining responses were in English.

3. What proportion of key performance indicators were achieved by March 2022? What KPIs were these?

We hold no such recorded information. The Anti Racist Wales Action Plan was published on 7 June 2022. We do not hold information about KPIs achieved by March 2022.

4. How many organisations have been awarded as "leads and partners"? Of these, what % are

- White-led and based in Wales
- Black, Asian and Minority Ethnic led and based in England
- BAME-led and based in Wales
- White led and based in England

The Anti-Racist Wales Action Plan includes detailed actions across a range of policy topics. Each action is supported by a description of key outputs and outcomes. It also states when the action is expected to be completed and the organisation or organisations responsible for delivery. These organisations are referred to in the column headed 'leads or partners'.

Organisations referred to as 'leads or partners' have not been awarded a particular status. It reflects their organisational remit as having responsibility for implementing the actions. They are primarily public sector bodies, based in Wales.

A list can be found on page 29 onwards of the plan itself. We do not hold ethnicity data regarding these organisations:

[Anti-Racist Wales Action Plan \(gov.wales\)](#)

5. How did the Anti Racism Wales Action Plan give due regard to the Welsh Language Act?

An Integrated Impact Assessment was completed for the Anti-racism Wales Action Plan. Link here: [41912 An Anti-Racist Wales: Integrated Impact Assessment \(gov.wales\)](#)

All work relating to the Anti-racism Wales Action Plan adhered to both the Welsh Language (Wales) Measure 2011 and the Welsh Language Act 1993.

6. Please provide the Welsh Language Commissioner's consultation response.

We did not receive a consultation response from the Welsh Language Commissioner.

7. How has the Welsh government regulated the public sector equality duty in organisations that are beneficiaries of Welsh government funding, such as Creative Wales from 2011 onwards?

The Equality and Human Rights Commission (EHRC) acts as the regulator which ensure compliance and delivery of actions which support PSED. Information on its regulatory role, responsibilities and powers of redress can be found at:

[Public Sector Equality Duty | Equality and Human Rights Commission \(equalityhumanrights.com\)](http://equalityhumanrights.com)

8. How many BAME people have published books with grants that have been disseminated by organisations funded by Welsh Gov, who regulates PSED when it comes to funding?

We do not hold this information.

9. How much money did it cost to make the anti-racism Wales action plan?

The total spending on creating the ARWAP was just under: £250,000.

10. Please provide BFI's consultation response to the ARWAP

We do not hold this information and do not have a record of the British Film Institute providing a consultation response.