



17 August 2023

Dear ,

**ATISN 18784 – Made in Wales**

**Information requested**

Thank you for your request which I received on 29 July 2023. You asked for:

1. *How much money have you contributed to "Made in Wales" scheme that Creative Wales is a part of?*
2. *Please provide a breakdown of costs for "Made in Wales"*
3. *How much has the Welsh government given to the "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" report?*
4. *How much did the "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" cost?*
5. *Please publish any documents that include items like "Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic producer"*

**Our response**

1. *How much money have you contributed to "Made in Wales" scheme that Creative Wales is a part of?*

The Welsh Government/Creative Wales funding supports the Made in Wales Officer post. Since the post was announced in January 2020 the total amount awarded is **£89,966.69** (Revenue).

2. *Please provide a breakdown of costs for "Made in Wales"*

The Welsh Government/Creative Wales funding support for the Made in Wales Officer post by financial year:

<b>Financial year</b>	<b>£</b>
2021-2022	27,610.50
2022-2023	28,805.80
2023-2024	33,550.39*
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>89,966.69</b>

*\*the 33,550.39 is the total amount awarded for 2023-2024 not the actual amount paid.*

3. *How much has the Welsh government given to the "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" report?*

The Welsh Government does not hold this information. The funding provided by the Welsh Government is for the Made in Wales Officer post as detailed above.

4. *How much did the "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" cost?*

The Welsh Government does not hold this information. The "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" report was commissioned by Made in Wales.

5. *Please publish any documents that include items like "Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic producer"*

I have interpreted this question to relate to the "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" report in the previous question. The Welsh Government does not hold this information. The "Finding Welsh Film Data 2021/22" report was commissioned by Made in Wales. It would be for Made in Wales to publish any documents.

## **Next steps**

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government's handling of your request, you can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response. Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government's Freedom of Information Officer at:

Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government,  
Cathays Park,  
Cardiff,  
CF10 3NQ

or Email: [Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales](mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales)

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF.

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it has been through our own internal review process.

Yours sincerely