22 January 2024
Dear

ATISN 20027- Children and Young People’s Services

Thank you for your email received on 20 December 2023 which was dealt with under the
Freedom of Information Act (2000). You have requested the following:

For the year 2022/2023 per child/annum and per adult/annum in Education/Social
Services/Health services

1. Provide figures for spending on Children and Young People and adult mental health
difficulties in Wales with a breakdown of each sector

2. Provide statistics for obesity rates, sedentary lifestyles and the associated costs
3. Provide figures of the cost of adult crime with a history of conduct disorder

Our Response

1 Welsh Government does not hold the information at the level you are requesting
on the cost of providing mental health services. We can provide details of the grants
we give Local Authorities to support the whole school approach to mental health and
wellbeing and this is published as part of our annual budget. A breakdown of spend
per category for the NHS can be seen here

For more information you will need to contact the relevant local authorities. Contact
details can be found here

Welsh Government also receives data from the Financial Planning and Delivery team
within the NHS Wales Executive. They can be contacted here

You may find it useful to contact Health Boards. Details are here

2 In relation to obesity rates in children and young people, Public Health Wales publish
data on the child measurement programme for young children and the School health
research network produce a national report which has self-reported BMI of older
children as well as sedentary behaviour. For adults data on BMI is published in these
reports and tables: Adult lifestyle (National Survey for Wales) | GOV.WALES

3 Criminal justice is not devolved to Wales and is the responsibility of the UK
Government. On that basis, Welsh Government does not hold the information
being requested on the cost of adult crime with a history of conduct disorder. The
most recent official estimates from Home Office are for 2015/16 (published in 2018)
and don’t include breakdowns for Wales - The economic and social costs of crime.
For further Information please contact the Home Office at
foirequests@homeoffice.gov.uk, as they may hold the information requested.



https://statswales.gov.wales/Catalogue/Health-and-Social-Care/Health-Finance/NHS-Programme-Budget/nhsexpenditureperhead-by-budgetcategory-year
https://www.gov.wales/find-your-local-authority
https://executive.nhs.wales/about-us/contact-us/
https://www.gov.wales/nhs-wales-health-boards-and-trusts
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fphw.nhs.wales%2Fservices-and-teams%2Fchild-measurement-programme%2Freports-and-data%2F&data=05%7C02%7CIan.Turner%40gov.wales%7C1d264bf0bf664bea3f8408dc169e4863%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638410116274553902%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wCAtaRPhNL0S9eXf86VrdHt1fh8F0EXCI7QfRiaXqWA%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.shrn.org.uk%2Fnational-data%2F&data=05%7C02%7CIan.Turner%40gov.wales%7C1d264bf0bf664bea3f8408dc169e4863%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638410116274553902%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=t7EYHNQMCDN%2B%2B9%2BLqJ0fCmo9gBJm36IEWCJEYLmGGCs%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.gov.wales%2Fadult-lifestyle-national-survey-wales&data=05%7C02%7CIan.Turner%40gov.wales%7C1d264bf0bf664bea3f8408dc169e4863%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638410116274553902%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=GIGdV6EOcfkD4sQOtrkY2GOKlGlDvzEYLJf1RtUbpZc%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.gov.uk%2Fgovernment%2Fpublications%2Fthe-economic-and-social-costs-of-crime&data=05%7C02%7CIan.Turner%40gov.wales%7Cf8e726f659f04a20e61f08dc16a8f65b%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638410162140776274%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=qKnIIonbkNHe55%2F35Cp0DVR9DcnyLHMdOoG6tGIor5o%3D&reserved=0
mailto:foirequests@homeoffice.gov.uk

Next steps

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can
ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s
Freedom of Information Officer at:

Information Rights Unit,
Welsh Government,
Cathays Park,

Cardiff,

CF10 3NQ

or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information
Commissioner can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office,

Wycliffe House,

Water Lane,

Wilmslow,

Cheshire,

SK9 5AF.

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it
has been through our own internal review process.

Yours sincerely,


mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

